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Abstract 
___________________________________________________________  
This study aims to develop an application to report the results of 
Match Commissioner (MC) ASKOT PSSI Medan. Furthermore, 
this application is to improve the human resources of ASKOT PSSI 
Medan specifically for match equipment, namely MC. This research 
method is the development research of Budiono Saputro which 
adopts Borg & Gall and Sukmadinata, then this research uses 2 
(two) stages, namely stage 1 literature study, conducting literature 
review and needs analysis (needs questionnaire), then designing a 
product model and stage 2 developing and planning models do make 
applications, expert validation and revisions, individual trials and 
revisions, and group trials. The MC assessment of the application of 
the MC report results in the display aspect was 84.81% in the very 
good category, in the content / material aspect of 86.53% it was in 
the very good category, in the usage aspect it was 85.46% in the 
very category. good, and in the overall aspect of 85.76% it is in the 
very good category. It is concluded that the MC report application 
based on the assessment data of the MC ASKOT PSSI Medan city 
of the application developed is suitable for use with improvements 
according to suggestions and input, then used as the final product of 
this study. 
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INTRODUCTION  

The Indonesian government strives 

to develop in all fields in order to create a 

just and prosperous society, one of which 

is in the fields of sports and education. The 

development of sports has the goal of 

increasing physical fitness, achievement, 

discipline, sportsmanship, and others. 

Furthermore, development in the field of 

education aims at the quality of Human 

Resources (HR), namely physically and 

mentally healthy, skilled, broad insight, 

and commendable attitude and behavior. 

This development is an effort to maintain 

and improve the standard of human life by 

being programmed and carried out 

continuously (Prasetyo, 2015); (Malasari 

& Juntara, 2021). Indeed, the government 

is currently trying to improve human 

resources so that it is perpendicular to 

what it aspires to, namely creating a just 

and prosperous society, especially in the 

fields of sports and education with short 

and long term planning where the ultimate 

goal is developed countries. In line with 

the improvement of human resources, the 

development of sports can be seen in the 

presence of innovations in training 

models, facilities and infrastructure to 

support human resource capabilities. This 

innovation is useful as a support for sports 

activities as the achievement of goals set 

both on the training side, match support 

and evaluation (Supriyono, 2018). 

In line with the expression from the 

Ministry of Youth and Sports through 

Djoko Pekik Irianto, developed countries 

are carried out to improve regional and 

national sports achievements, namely 

through Mastery of Science and 

Technology (IPTEK), and it must be 

admitted that Indonesia is still lagging 

behind developed countries from mastery 

of science and technology. So in 

increasing the sport, science and 

technology has become the spearhead of 

developed countries (Rohmat, 2014). The 

conclusions from some of these references 

explain building a just and prosperous 

society as a goal that is set to become a 

developed country through increasing 

human resources in the fields of sports and 

education. The improvement of human 

resources in the sports and education fields 

rests on mastery of science and 

technology, especially in terms of 

facilities, infrastructure, training, 

competition support, evaluation and other 

aspects. 

The world of football through 

FIFA has made new breakthroughs in the 

quality and professionalism of a 

competition or match, one of which is the 

use of VAR (video Assistant Referee) 

which aims to see one event that the 

referee does not see every match. The use 

of VAR was carried out for the first time 

at the 2018 World Cup in Russia and until 

now it has been carried out in European 

leagues, Meanwhile in Indonesia the 

discourse is used in the 2019 Premier 

League but until now PSSI has not used 

VAR (Bidikdot.com, 2020). The author 

concludes that there is a breakthrough that 

has been made by FIFA for the game of 

football, namely the development of 

science and technology, one of which is 

VAR, this is very important to see an 

incident that is not seen by the referee and 

does not rule out other breakthroughs. 
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Furthermore, in chapter VIII, the 

general rules for the Indonesian Football 

Association (PSSI) explain the soccer 

matches being played, including match 

supervisors, referee inspectors and 

referees. The match supervisor as the 

supervisor of the game, the referee 

inspector as an evaluation of the 

performance of the referee and the referee 

has the authority and responsibility for the 

match, the three important components 

that cannot be separated from every match 

(Khuliman, 2018). It can be concluded that 

the components of the soccer match 

equipment consist of the MC, the referee 

inspector and the referee, this component 

is very vital in a soccer match because this 

component is the standard of a soccer 

match. HR Medan City Association 

(ASKOT) PSSI Medan currently has 23 

Match Commissioners (MC) as shown in 

table 1 below; 

Table 1. Data Match Commissioner 

(MC) ASKOT PSSI Medan City 

No Category  Total 

1 Region 6 

2 National 17 

(source: Data Askot PSSI Medan City) 

MC data 23 people who have a 

regional category license / certificate there 

are 6 people and nationally there are 17 

people, of these 23 MCs who are often 

assigned to Liga 1 PSSI (the highest 

football match in Indonesia) as many as 4 

people and 19 people have never been 

assigned to Liga 1 PSSI at all. This 

condition is directly proportional to what 

has been done so far, namely in making the 

results of the match report for the MC 

ASKOT PSSI Medan city still manually 

using the MC and ASKOT PSSI Medan 

match report form and does not have an 

application that makes it easy for match 

reports. As revealed by Reilly & Williams 

(2003) (Barreira et al., 2013) football is the 

most popular sport in the world, so it is one 

of the sources of the development of 

science and technology. Which is a good 

example of the latest research on the 

development of cutting-edge technology, 

including in the form of practical 

applications and web in the form of 

software (Supriyono, 2018). According to 

the authors, the development of science 

and technology in sports, especially in 

football, by developing cutting-edge 

technology such as the web or application 

which aims to store data that occurs and 

facilitate the implementation of soccer 

matches. Furthermore, the authors in this 

study make and develop a match report 

application for the MC ASKOT PSSI 

Medan City, North Sumatra. 

With the availability of this 

application, it is hoped that it will make it 

easier for MC ASKOT PSSI Medan in 

making reports on local and national 

football game matches. Improving the 

human resources of ASKOT PSSI Medan, 

namely MC by using this application is 

able to compete at the national level in 

leading League 1, Liga2, Liga 3 and 

National Sports Week matches. It is hoped 

that it will also facilitate the Medan City 

ASKOT PSSI in organizing soccer 

matches in the city of Medan. This is 

emphasized by the expression that 

technology development provides 

integrated solutions in all related fields 

(Munthali, George & Xuelian, 2020). 

Next, there is research by Ilya Solntsev 

and Nikita Osokin explaining that in 

Russia, the development of football is 

needed as a recommendation on how to 

better coordinate football match activities 

in Russia (Solntsev & Osokin, 2018). 

METHODS 

This research uses development 

research or other terms Research & 

Development (R&D), according to Borg 

and Gall (1983) Sukmadinata (2008) and 
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Sugiyono (2009) research methods in 

certain fields produce a certain product, 

and in together with certain additional 

products that have the effectiveness of a 

product in a concrete way, for example: 

education management, examples of 

integrated science training management 

model products, science education 

examples of integrated science material 

books and computer sample software 

(Budiono Saputro, 2017). This research 

has produced a product that has been 

tested for its effectiveness in the form of a 

match results report application. The 

purpose of this research is not to test or 

formulate a theory, but to develop a match 

result report application that is effective 

for use by MC ASKOT PSSI Medan and 

others in soccer matches in Medan. 

The population of this research is 

MC Askot PSSI Medan, North Sumatra. 

The subjects of the research trials were 

MC ASKOT Medan, totaling 23 people. 

This study uses the Budiyono Saputro 

development design which adopts the 

development of Borg & Gall and 

Sukmadinata. Divided into 3 stages, 

namely stage 1 preliminary study, stage 2 

model development and planning, and 

stage 3 model validation (Budiyono 

Saputro, 2017). The steps of this research 

carry out 2 stages, namely a preliminary 

study and the development and design of 

the model can be seen in Figure 1 below: 

  

 
 

Figure 1. Model Development Procedure 

(Budiono Saputro, 2017) 

 

Collecting data for this 

development research uses instruments that 

are able to explore the data needs used. The 

instrument used is an instrument to assess 

the application. This instrument is in the 

form of a questionnaire for material 

experts, media experts and MC. This 

research uses quantitative descriptive 

analysis techniques and qualitative 

descriptive analysis. Quantitative 

descriptive analysis was carried out to 

analyze the value scale data of the 

assessment results on the draft model, 

product assessment data, individual trial 

data, and group trial data. Meanwhile, 

qualitative descriptive analysis was carried 

out to explore deficiency data and input to 

the application before the trial and after the 

field trial. 
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Population is a comprehensive area 

consisting of: objects / subjects that have 

certain qualities and characteristics that 

are determined by the researcher for study 

and then draw conclusions (Sugiono, 

2019). The population of this research is 

MC Askot PSSI Medan North Sumatra, 

amounting to 23 people trials. A 

researcher is forced to be satisfied using a 

cluster sample because the clumps which 

are groups of individuals are available as 

units in the population, sampling in a 

cluster that has the same opportunity to 

become a sample from one population 

(Suryabrata, 2016). The people who tested 

this research were the MC ASKOT PSSI 

Medan city, amounting to 19 people who 

have regional certificates and who have 

never served in the PSSI League 1. For 

individual trials with a total of 6 MC 

ASKOT PSSI Medan city, and for a group 

trial with a total of 13 MC ASKOT PSSI 

Medan city. 

Design or Data Analysis 

A preliminary study is carried out 

for data collection / needs analysis through 

field studies and literature studies. The 

analysis began with the field study of 

distributing questionnaires to the MC 

ASKOT PSSI Medan City which was 

certified Regional MC. Following are the 

results of a preliminary study using a 

survey questionnaire: 100% can operate a 

laptop, 82.61% have never used the MC 

application from PSSI, 100% of the 

matches held by ASKOT PSSI Medan use 

MC reports for smooth and professional 

matches, at 100% MC requires a match 

report application, and 100% MC agrees 

with the development of the match report 

application. So that in the future an MC 

match report application will be created 

that makes it easy and professional in the 

implementation of football matches. 

Application Design or Initial 

draft The initial draft design 

consists of: application operational 

planning, menu, and expert judgment. 

Validation is carried out by submitting the 

initial product draft of the application 

design accompanied by an assessment 

sheet using a value scale in which there are 

input, suggestions, and revisions to 

experts. The results of the assessment are 

in the form of a scale of the truth value of 

the content of the material concept and 

media aspects of the application using a 

scale Likert with a choice of 5 categories. 

The results of an expert's assessment of the 

application draft are presented in table 2 

below: 

Table 2. Expert Validation Results Data 

on DraftApplication 

No Expert % Category 

1. Material 82,45 Good 

2. Media 81,01 Good 

Table 2 shows the assessment of 

material experts shows a percentage of 

82.45% is in the good category and the 

assessment of media experts shows the 

percentage of 81.01% is in the good 

category. This shows that the two experts' 

assessment of the application made was 

feasible to be developed with revisions.  

 

Product Trial Results 

Material expert assessment 

provides an assessment of the application 

being developed and provides suggestions 

for improvements for subsequent revision 

of the application. The application 

assessment result data is calculated from the 

maximum number of items and the real 
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score obtained is then converted to a 

percentage table. The results of the material 

expert's assessment of the MC football 

match report application can be seen in 

table 3 below:    

 

Table 3. Data on the Results of Material 

Expert Assessment of the Application. 

 

Material 

Assessment 

% Category 

Application 93,46 Very Good 

Furthermore, the media expert's 

assessment provides an assessment of the 

MC match report application developed 

and provides suggestions for 

improvements for further revision. The 

results of the media expert's assessment of 

the MC match report application can be 

seen in table 4 below: 

Table 4. Data on the results of the 

MediaApplication 

expert assessment % Category 

Expert 

1 

Application 87,45 Very good 

Expert 

2 

Application 86,89 Very good 

 

Individual Trial Results 

Implementation of individual trials 

was carried out by demonstrating to 6 MC 

ASKOT PSSI Medan City people who 

were randomly selected previously as trial 

people. The process of implementing the 

feasibility trial of this application uses a 

demonstration of how the MC Match 

results report application has been 

developed, then the MC is given time to 

operationalize the application as well as 

mentoring. Then to find out the quality of 

the developed application, the researcher 

gave the MC an assessment sheet. During 

the process of filling out the scoring sheet, 

the MC can still review the match 

supervisor report application. In table 5, 

the results of the MC assessment of the 

application of the MC results report on the 

individual trial are presented: 

Table 5. Data on the results of the MC 

assessment of the application in 

theIndividual Trial 

MC % Category 

Display 85,56 Very Good 

Content / 

Material 

84,75 Very Good 

Use 86,85 Very Good 

Overall 87,75 Very Good 

 

MC assessment of the MC results 

report application in the display aspect 

shows a percentage of 85.56% is in the very 

good category, in the content / material 

aspect shows a percentage of 84.75% is in 

the very good category, On the aspect of 

ease of use, it shows a percentage of 86.85% 

is in the very good category, and for the 

overall aspect shows a percentage of 

87.75% is in the very good category. This 

shows that the MC assessment on the MC 

ASKOT PSSI report application results in 

the city of Medan on an individual trial is 

feasible with improvements in accordance 

with the suggestions and input, which is 

then continued with a wider scale trial. 

 

Results of Group Trials The 

implementation of group trials 

was carried out by demonstrating to 13 

MC ASKOT PSSI Medan City who were 

randomly selected previously as trial 

people. The process carried out in the trial 

of the feasibility group for the MC results 

report application is by demonstrating how 

the MC match results report application 

has been developed, then the MC is given 

time to operationalize the application as 

well as mentoring. To obtain the quality of 

the application developed, the researcher 

provided an assessment sheet to the MC. 

During the process of filling in the MC 

scoring sheet, you can also review the 
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application of the MC match results report 

that was done. Table 6 below presents the 

results of the MC's assessment of the MC 

match results report in the following group 

trials. 

Table 6. Data Assessment MC on Trial 

Application Group 

MC % Kategori 

Display 84,81 Very Good 

Content / 

Material 

86, 53 Very Good 

Use 85,46 Very Good 

Overall 85,76 Very Good 

 

MC's assessment of the MC match results 

report application in the display aspect of 

84.81% is in the very good category, in the 

content / material aspect of 86.53% is in the 

very good category, in the usage aspect of 

85.46% is in the very category good, and in 

the overall aspect of 85.76% it is in the very 

good category. This shows that MC's 

assessment of the MC match result report 

application in the group trial is feasible with 

the improvements according to the 

suggestions and can be used as the final 

product of this study.  

  
MC Application Improvement  

Improvement of this research 

product application was carried out 2 (two) 

times, namely: 1) the first improvement 

was made in the validation stage, and 2) 

the second improvement was carried out 

after the feasibility test of the application. 

This improvement is based on data from 

suggestions and input from material 

experts and media experts. The results of 

the improvements can be seen in table 7 

next. Suggestions and input from this 

expert validation serve as the basis for 

researchers to make improvements to the 

initial product application before 

conducting individual trials. Researchers 

review the suggestions and input of 

experts for improving the developed 

applications, these suggestions and input 

are very helpful for researchers as a basis 

for improving applications that are the 

product of this research.  

Table 7. Suggestions and Feedback from 

Expert 

Expert Category 

Matter  Already according to 

reference; 

 Add a recap of the number 

of goals scored by players; 

 Add red card recap and 

yellow card to see which 

team is fairest play; and 

 In the future, applications for 

referee inspectors, referees 

and assistant referees will 

also be made. 

Media 1  The use of color in the 

application is less attractive 

 The writing on the 

application should not be too 

small; and 

 Connecting between the 

Player Name List (DNP) 

input by the club, the List of 

Players (DSP) in the MC 

content; 

Media 2  Color combination must be 

attractive 

 Username for logging in the 

List of Players (DNP), use 

the club email; and 

 Connecting between the 

validity of the data with the 

DNP as well as the DSP. 

The second improvement data used is 

the suggestion and input data used by the 

researcher obtained after the implementation 

of individual trials. Suggestions and input data 

from individual trials obtained by the 

researcher can be seen in table 8 below: 

Table 8. Suggestions and Input Data 

from Individual Trials 

No Suggestions and Inputs 

1. Secepatnya digunakan MC yang ada 

di Sumatera Utara; 



Nurkadri et al / Kinestetik : Jurnal Ilmiah Pendidikan Jasmani 5 (2) (2021) 

263 

2. Very useful application for match 

devices; 

3. Very helpful MC in carrying out 

tasks; 

 

Then the researcher continued the 

group trial after making improvements to 

the application that was developed based on 

the suggestions and input of the test person 

in the individual trial that was completed.  

 

RESULT 

Next, after the draft application 

design is completed, it is developed and 

translated into application programming 

on the Web. The design stage is the stage 

of preparing an application framework as 

well as related to its functions. In the MC 

ASKOT PSSI match results application 

application, Medan city includes several 

sections and pages such as: menu page, 

DNP page, DSP page, match result report 

page, and match result recapitulation page. 

At this stage the application is made to the 

review of material experts and media 

experts as well as application 

improvements. An assessment of the 

application has been developed in the form 

of an application report on the results of 

the MC ASKOT PSSI Medan City 

showing positive results. This application 

has undergone several revisions from 

material experts, media experts and has 

gone through the trial phase. 

As deepening and expanding 

knowledge is research development, 

developing is the beginning of the word 

development which means making it more 

perfect by means, processes or actions to 

develop. The purpose of development is 

not to formulate and test theories but to 

improve existing or non-existent designs 

or products in solving real problems, 

where the design or product developed is 

effective for use anywhere (Sugiono, 

2016); (Arisandi, 2013); (Universitas 

Negeri Malang, 2010); (Darmadi, 2019); 

(Nurkadri, 2019). The development of the 

MC results report application is based on a 

needs analysis, namely to help facilitate 

the MC ASKOT PSSI Medan city, the 

football club and the interests of the 

Medan city ASKOT. This need is in 

accordance with the results of a field 

survey by distributing questionnaires to 23 

MCs ASKOT PSSI Medan City, 100% can 

operate a laptop, 82.61% have never used 

the MC application from PSSI, for 100% 

of the matches held by ASKOT PSSI 

Medan using reports MC for smooth and 

professional matches, 100% of MC 

requires a match report application, and 

100% MC agrees with the development of 

the match report application. 

Based on these data, an application 

for the MC ASKOT PSSI results report 

was developed in Medan. The 

development of this application is a 

product that is feasible for the MC 

ASKOT PSSI Medan city as a report on 

the results of a soccer match and a must-

have for ASKOT PSSI Medan. Making it 

easier for the management of soccer match 

equipment in the city of Medan. Similar to 

the statement the use of such technology 

with a suitable user interface will empower 

the coach to gain insight into existing 

performance levels more readily and 

conveniently the use of such technology 

with a suitable user interface will empower 

the coach to gain insight into existing 

performance level more readily and 

conveniently (Pope III et al., 2009). It is 

concluded that the use of technology in the 

game of soccer provides flexibility and 

convenience to the match equipment in 

increasing ability easily, precisely and 

efficiently. Next explained that the use of 

multimedia facilitates and makes all work 

easier (Fitriadi & Rachman, 2014). 

The MC ASKOT PSSI results 

report application for Medan city consists 

of several main menus, namely: first the 

Player Name List (PNL), the second home 

menu the Player Composition List (PCL), 

the three home menuMC report home 
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menus, and the fourth an application to 

recap the results of matches and players. 

So based on the results of the assessment 

of material experts and media experts, 

improvements, individual trials and group 

trials, the development of the MC ASKOT 

PSSI results report application in Medan, 

it can be concluded from the results 

obtained that this application is feasible to 

use. So that in the future there will be a 

match device report application that makes 

it easier to carry out football matches.  

CONCLUSION 

The results of the analysis of needs 

analysis and data analysis of expert 

assessments and mc askot pssi medan city, 

that the steps to develop the application of 

the askot pssi mc medan results report 

application, namely starting from stage 1, 

conducting a preliminary study, gathering 

information, and designing; stage 2 

development and modeling, expert 

validation and revision, individual trials 

and revisions, group trials and final 

products. 
Furthermore, this mc application 

has several menus such as: 1) PNL home 

menu, 2) PCL home menu, 3) MC report 

home menu, and 4) match results and 

player recap application. This is indicated 

by the results of group trials on the display 

aspect of 84.81% in the very good 

category, in the content / material aspect of 

86.53% in the very good category, in the 

use aspect of 85.46% it is in the very 

category. Good, and in the overall aspect 

of 85.76% it is in the very good category. 
This application is expected to 

provide benefits to: 1) the development of 

science can develop other applications for 

soccer match devices such as referee 

inspectors and referees, 2) the next 

research can serve as a guide, 3) the ease 

and efficiency of mc in carrying out their 

duties as a football match supervisor ball, 

4) the implementation of a soccer match 

held at ASKOT PSSI Medan city, and 5) 

increasing the human resources of 

ASKOT PSSI Medan city, namely mc 

ASKOT PSSI Medan city towards 

technological developments. 
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